
 
Introducing….PEGASUS, A Leadership Program for Women! 
 
This new and very exciting program brings women and our horses together to 
discover their communication, leadership, and problem solving skills. Set in a 
very controlled environment participants and our horses engage in a series of 
ground exercises. These exercises offer a challenging way for women to “muscle 
memory” creative ideas to better understand themselves and the way they relate 
to others. Equine assisted learning is a new concept and very well received.  
 
Based on the philosophy of “See, Do, Teach” the program promotes self 
awareness. Interaction with the horses, intuitive beings who mirror emotions, 
gives the women instant feedback. Positive reinforcement is paramount and a 
consistent part of the presentation. Women leave energized! 
 
Your organization will benefit by topics such as attitude adjustment, overcoming 
fears, team goal setting, and creating new ideas.  
 
Presented by Denise Maryanski, a seasoned motivational speaker and creative 
entrepreneur. My business background includes a success real estate career 
participating in the sale of over 4000 new homes, developing a residential 
investment company, co-creating Bone Appetite Bakery for Dogs with 
international sales and national franchising. Currently designing equestrian 
products sold internationally through Schutz Brothers of Manchester, Indiana and 
presenting Horses in Harmony, a series of equestrian clinics. I understand 
business planning and what it takes to reach personal and professional goals.  
 
I would like the opportunity to visit with you and discuss how PEGASUS can 
benefit your organization. Some companies choose to send personnel others use 
the program as promotion for customers or potential customers. The program is 
limited to 12 participates to guarantee personal attention. The corporate group 
rate is $600 including lunches.  
 
 
Discover a new way to challenge your “herd”.  
 

 
 
 
 
 



 


